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Introduction
This strategy is compiled according to the Ministry of Housing, Communities and Local 
Government’s Guidance on Local Government Investments (“the Guidance”) and the 2017 
revised CIPFA Treasury Management in Public Services Code of Practice and Cross 
Sectoral Guidance Notes (“the CIPFA TM Code”) It sets out the Council’s policies for 
managing its investments and for giving priority to the security and liquidity of those 
investments.

The Guidance distinguishes between Treasury Management Investments and Other 
Investments. Treasury Management Investments are those which arise from the Council’s 
cash flows and debt management activity and ultimately represent balances which need to 
be invested until the cash is required for use in the course of business. Other Investments 
are all those falling outside of normal treasury management activity, as defined above. They 
may be made with the express purpose of making a financial surplus for the Council, usually 
as a means towards balancing the revenue budget. They may be funded from borrowing 
where appropriate. The prime example referred to in the Guidance is direct investment in 
property assets. Loans, for example to voluntary organisations, local enterprises or joint 
ventures are also classified as Other Investments. 

The Council invests its money for three broad purposes:

 because it has surplus cash as a result of its day-to-day activities, for example when 
income is received in advance of expenditure (known as treasury management 
investments),

 to support local public services by lending to or buying shares in other organisations 
(service investments), and

 to earn investment income (known as commercial investments where this is the main 
purpose).

This investment strategy is a new strategy for 2019/20, meeting the requirements of 
statutory guidance issued by the government in January 2018, and focuses on the second 
and third of these categories. 

Possible Revisions to the Strategy
The initial strategy may be replaced with a revised strategy at any time during the year in 
cases where any treasury management issues (including investment issues) need to be 
brought to the attention of Full Council.  

Treasury Management Investments 
The Council typically receives its income in cash (e.g. from taxes and grants) before it pays 
for its expenditure in cash (e.g. through payroll and invoices). It also holds reserves for future 
expenditure and collects local taxes on behalf of other local authorities and central 
government. These activities, plus the timing of borrowing decisions, lead to a cash surplus 
which is invested in accordance with guidance from the Chartered Institute of Public Finance 
and Accountancy. The balance of treasury management investments is expected to fluctuate 
between £0m and £10m during the 2019/20 financial year.

Contribution: The contribution that these investments make to the objectives of the Council is 
to support effective treasury management activities.

Further details: Full details of the Council’s policies and its plan for 2019/20 for treasury 
management investments are covered in a separate document, the treasury management 
strategy.



 

 

Service Investments: Loans
Contribution: During 2018/19 the Council has not lent money to local charities, housing 
associations or any other bodies. However the Council would consider applications from 
such bodies individually, in order to support local public services and stimulate local 
economic growth.

Security: The main risk when making service loans is that the borrower will be unable to 
repay the principal lent and/or the interest due. In order to limit this risk, and ensure that total 
exposure to service loans remains proportionate to the size of the Council, upper limits on 
the outstanding loans to each category of borrower have been set as follows:

Loans for service purposes in £ thousands

31/03/2018 Actual 2019/20Category of 
borrower

Balance 
owing

Loss 
allowance

Net figure 
in 
accounts

Approved 
Limit

Local charities 0 0 0 500

Housing associations 0 0 0 500

Other bodies 0 0 0 500

TOTAL 0 0 0 1,500

Accounting standards require the Council to set aside loss allowance for loans, reflecting the 
likelihood of non-payment. The figures for loans in the Council’s statement of accounts from 
2018/19 onwards will be shown net of this loss allowance. However, the Council makes 
every reasonable effort to collect the full sum lent and has appropriate credit control 
arrangements in place to recover overdue repayments.

Risk assessment: The Council assesses the risk of loss before entering into and whilst 
holding service loans on an individual basis for each proposal. The risks inherent in the 
proposal will be reported to members when it is placed before them for consideration 
together with an assessment of the likelihood of any of them materialising, their impact on 
the revenue budget and the mitigating controls that will be put in place. Risk factors to be 
assessed include:

 barriers to entry into and exit out of the market concerned;

 the nature and level of competition;

 how the market and customer needs will evolve over time;

 ongoing need for further investment to be made; and

 whether there is sufficient internal capacity to assess the business case and risks 
relating to the proposal.

An initial review of each proposal will be carried out by Council officers, intended to 
determine whether there are any risks apparent at that stage which indicate that the 
proposal should not be proceeded with. Provided this is not the case and it has also been 
determined that there is a worthwhile business case for further consideration, a more 
detailed risk assessment will be carried out. Where necessary, owing to lack of internal 
expertise, external advisors may be used to assist with the assessment of appropriate risks. 
Any other appropriate sources of information may be used to assess and monitor risk, 



 

 

including credit ratings, if these are relevant. Data used to monitor ongoing risk will be 
reviewed regularly and appropriate action will be taken if there are any indications of 
increasing risk or risks materialising. 

The Council will consider the following points:

 the degree to which the loan complies with corporate policies and furthers corporate 
objectives;

 the overall desirability of the activity which the loan is intended to fund;

 affordability in terms of the use of capital or other resources and impact on the 
revenue budget;

 the likelihood that the loan will be repaid in accordance with agreed terms; and

 the total amount of loans already made to ensure that as a whole the Council is not 
over-exposed to the risk of default.

All proposed loans will be subject to approval by members, normally via Full Council, 
following consideration of a report setting out all relevant matters, including compliance with 
the above criteria.

All loans will be subject to credit control arrangements to recover overdue repayments. 
Credit risk will be determined by reference to the “expected credit loss” model for loans and 
receivables as set out in International Reporting Standard (IFRS) 9 Financial Instruments. 

Service Investments: Shares
Contribution: The Council currently does not invest in the shares of suppliers and local 
businesses in order to support local public services and stimulate local economic growth. 
This is due to the nature of the risks associated with investing in shares i.e. they are volatile 
and may fall in value meaning that the initial outlay may not be recovered. If the Council was 
to consider investing in shares, then in order to limit the risk, upper limits on the sum 
invested in each category of shares would need to be set.

Shares held for service purposes in £ thousands

31/03/2018 actual 2019/20Category of 
company

Amounts 
invested

Gains or 
losses

Value in 
accounts

Approved 
Limit

Suppliers 0 0 0 250

Local businesses 0 0 0 250

TOTAL 0 0 0 500

Non-specified Investments: Shares are the only investment type that the Council has 
identified that meets the definition of a non-specified investment in the government 
guidance. The limits above on share investments are therefore also the Council’s upper 
limits on non-specified investments. The Council has not adopted any procedures for 
determining further categories of non-specified investment since none are likely to meet the 
definition. 

If the Council were to consider placing funds in any other type of investment which would be 
categorised as Non-Specified, the security of the capital sum would be the paramount 
concern. The same requirements as to credit ratings relating to Specified Investments will 



 

 

apply, and in appropriate cases the advice of the Council’s treasury management advisors 
will be sought.  

Commercial Investments: Property
Contribution: The Council invests in local commercial property with the intention of making a 
profit that will be spent on local public services. These are held primarily to earn income to 
be used to support the revenue budget although in some cases there may also be a 
contribution towards the economic wellbeing of the Borough. 
Security: In accordance with government guidance, the Council considers a property 
investment to be secure if its accounting valuation is at or higher than its purchase cost 
including taxes and transaction costs.

A fair value assessment of the Council’s investment property portfolio has been made within 
the past twelve months, and the underlying assets provide security for capital investment. 

The majority of the investment property portfolio was acquired some time ago and there is 
no debt associated with any of the properties and the initial investment costs have been 
recouped many years ago. Investment properties are valued at fair value. The values of the 
properties will fluctuate according to market conditions prevailing from time to time, however 
these fluctuations do not constitute losses of capital invested. The value of investment 
properties included in the Council’s balance sheet as at 31 March 2018 is £17.835m.

If there are any new commercial investments funded from borrowing, their value will be 
monitored to determine whether it is sufficient to act as security for the capital invested and 
outstanding borrowing. If there is a significant fall in value then this will be reported to 
members.

Risk assessment: There are risks associated with making and holding commercial 
investments which require assessment and management.

With regard to the Council’s current portfolio of commercial investments, comprising 
investment properties, the main risk is of not achieving the budgeted amount of income or of 
expenditure exceeding budgeted amounts. These risks are assessed and provided for via 
the assessment of the appropriate amount to hold in reserve in General Fund Balances. If 
the result of the assessment shows that current levels are inadequate, the necessary 
additional contribution will be made via inclusion in the Medium Term Financial Strategy.

With regard to consideration of proposed new commercial investment there will be additional 
risks to be assessed and taken account of. The degree of control which the Council has over 
the materialisation of these risks and its ability to mitigate them should they arise will be 
important considerations. In most, if not all, cases the Council will be operating in a 
competitive environment and possibly one which it is not experienced in operating within, all 
of which increases the level of risk.

A comprehensive risk assessment, taking account of all appropriate factors, will be carried 
out on an individual basis for each investment proposal. The risks inherent in the proposal 
will be reported to members when it is placed before them for consideration together with an 
assessment of the likelihood of any of them materialising, their impact on the revenue 
budget and otherwise and available mitigation measures. Risk factors to be assessed 
include:

 barriers to entry into and exit out of the market concerned;

 the nature and level of competition;

 how the market and customer needs will evolve over time;

 ongoing need for further investment to be made, for example to adapt investment 
property or repair defects or carry out cyclical maintenance; and



 

 

 whether there is sufficient internal capacity to assess the business case and risks 
relating to the proposal.

An initial review of each proposed investment will be carried out by Council officers, intended 
to determine whether there are any risks apparent at that stage which indicate that the 
proposal should not be proceeded with. Provided this is not the case and it has also been 
determined that there is a worthwhile business case for further consideration of the 
investment, a more detailed risk assessment will be carried out. Where necessary, owing to 
lack of internal expertise, external advisors may be used to assist with the assessment of 
appropriate risks. Any other appropriate sources of information may be used to assess and 
monitor risk, including credit ratings, if these are relevant. Data used to monitor ongoing risk 
will be reviewed regularly and appropriate action will be taken if there are any indications of 
increasing risk or risks materialising.

An independent review shall be undertaken by external investment property advisors on the 
Council’s existing commercial property portfolio. The recommendations from this review will 
be actioned where necessary. 

Liquidity: Compared with other investment types, property is relatively difficult to sell and 
convert to cash at short notice, and can take a considerable period to sell in certain market 
conditions. There is no outstanding borrowing in relation to the current portfolio so any sales 
proceeds would be available in full to support capital investment.

In the case of any future commercial property investments, the likely degree of liquidity will 
be a consideration in deciding whether to make the investment.

Loan Commitments and Financial Guarantees
Although not strictly counted as investments, since no money has exchanged hands yet, 
loan commitments and financial guarantees carry similar risks to the Council and are 
included here for completeness. To date, the Council is not contractually committed to make 
any loans.

Proportionality 
The Council is dependent on profit generating investment activity to achieve a balanced 
revenue budget. The table below shows the extent to which the expenditure planned to meet 
the service delivery objectives of the Council is dependent on achieving the expected net 
profit from investments over the lifecycle of the Medium Term Financial Plan. 

Net investment property income is subject to fluctuation according to market conditions and 
other factors such as bad debts and unforeseen expenditure. Accordingly the possibility of 
shortfalls in contribution towards the revenue budget from this source is one of the factors 
specifically taken into consideration in calculating the level of General Fund balance to be 
held as a contingency against adverse budget variances. Currently a total of £1.200m is held 
in balances to cover this and other risks and can be drawn upon in the event of risks 
materialising.

It is not planned to vary the amount of investment property held in the short term. However, 
in accordance with the Asset Management Strategy, all such property will be kept under 
review to determine whether the return obtained justifies retention and there may be 
instances where it is decided to dispose of property to obtain a capital receipt. The net 
contribution made towards balancing the revenue budget and the options for replacing any 
significant loss of income will be one of the factors taken into account when determining 
whether or not to dispose of a property.



 

 

Borrowing in Advance of Need
The Prudential Code for Capital Finance in Local Authorities (2017) issued by CIPFA states 
that local authorities should not borrow more than or in advance of their needs purely to 
profit from the investment of the extra sums borrowed. This is repeated in the Statutory 
Investment Guidance issued by the Ministry of Housing, Communities and Local 
Government.

The reasons for making an investment are unlikely to be purely in order to make a profit 
since investments may also be made with the intention of furthering corporate aims or 
service objectives, such as economic regeneration.

Accordingly, borrowing will be permitted in respect of Other Investments. The Council will 
consider each proposal to borrow on its merits. As well as the corporate or service benefits 
due regard will be given to the financial impact upon the revenue budget in terms of capital 
financing costs. 

All borrowing will be subject to approval by members, normally via Full Council, following 
consideration of a report setting out all relevant matters, including those referred to above.

Capacity, Skills and Culture
Council members and staff involved in dealing with Other Investments will have regard to the 
provisions of the CIPFA Prudential Code and the regulatory regime within which local 
authorities operate when carrying out these functions. 

Investment in commercial property is a specialist area and the Council does not presently 
have sufficient skills and knowledge in house to effectively appraise investment proposals or 
to negotiate with third parties or manage certain types of investment on an ongoing basis. 
Accordingly, it will be necessary to supplement internal resources with external advice, 
commissioned on a case by case basis and where asset management is required external 
managers may need to be employed, particularly if investment is made in residential 
property.

Decisions to make Other Investments and the means of financing them will be subject to 
member approval. This will normally be by Full Council (but may be by Cabinet where 
permitted by the Council’s Constitution). Members will consider a report setting out all 
matters relevant to the making of an investment before making a decision. The normal 
scrutiny and call-in arrangements will apply.

The Investment Strategy will be approved by Full Council.



 

 

Investment Indicators
The Council has set the following quantitative indicators to allow elected members and the 
public to assess the Council’s total risk exposure as a result of its investment decisions.

Gross and Net Income - Historic and Current Year

2015/16 
Actual

2016/17 
Actual

2017/18 
Actual

2018/19 
Estimate

£’000 £’000 £’000 £’000

Commercial Properties

Gross Income 1,259 1,294 1,327 1,004

Gross Expenditure (571) (749) (871) (649)

Net Income 688 545 456 356

Net Service Expenditure (Whole Council) (6,235) (6,510) (6,776) (7,010)

Ratio of Net Income to Net Service 
Expenditure

11.03% 8.37% 6.73% 5.08%

Gross and Net Income - Over Period of Approved Medium Term Financial Strategy 2019/20 
to 2023/24 – Based on 2% increase on 2018/19

2019/20 
Estimate

2020/21 
Estimate

2021/22 
Estimate

2022/23 
Estimate 

2023/24 
Estimate

£’000 £’000 £’000 £’000 £’000

Gross 
Income

1024 1045 1065 1087 1108

Gross 
Expenditure

(662) (675) (689) (702) (717)

Net Income 362 369 377 384 392

Vacancy Levels

2015/16 
Actual

2016/17 
Actual

2017/18 
Actual

2018/19 
Target

% % % %

7.3 8.3 7.7 12.0


